
eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:03 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_1

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 76,729 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

1 of 2 20/08/2017 3:03 PM



Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-1

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Bukshi Khal near Fatikberia Primary School in G.P. Kashmoli of

Amta-II Block under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 38,36,437 Product Category CIVIL

WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Bukshi Khal near Fatikberia

Primary School

Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE

LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218578.xls BOQ 328.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:14 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

2 of 2 20/08/2017 3:03 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:04 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_2

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 83,369 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

1 of 2 20/08/2017 3:04 PM



Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-2

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Bukshi Khal at Fatikberia in G.P. Kashmoli of Amta-II Block

under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 41,68,443 Product Category CIVIL WORKS Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Bukshi Khal at Fatikberia Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218581.xls BOQ 328.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:33 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

2 of 2 20/08/2017 3:04 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:04 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_3

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 29,964 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

1 of 2 20/08/2017 3:04 PM



Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-3

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Bukshi Khal at Ch. 9.85 km in G.P. Kashmoli of Amta-II Block

under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 14,98,218 Product Category CIVIL

WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Bukshi Khal at Ch. 9.85

km

Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE

LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218582.xls BOQ 328.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:36 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

2 of 2 20/08/2017 3:04 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:05 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_4

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 79,495 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

1 of 2 20/08/2017 3:05 PM



Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-4

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Bukshi Khal at 11.17 km in G.P. Kashmoli of Amta-II Block

under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 39,74,737 Product Category CIVIL WORKS Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Bukshi Khal at 11.17 km Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218583.xls BOQ 328.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:39 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

2 of 2 20/08/2017 3:05 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:06 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_5

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 75,699 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

1 of 2 20/08/2017 3:06 PM



Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-5

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Bukshi Khal at 11.22 km in G.P. Kashmoli of Amta-II Block

under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 37,84,928 Product Category CIVIL WORKS Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Bukshi Khal at 11.22 km Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218584.xls BOQ 328.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:42 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

2 of 2 20/08/2017 3:06 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:06 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_6

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 72,045 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

1 of 2 20/08/2017 3:06 PM



Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-6

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Bukshi Khal at 11.26 km in G.P. Kashmoli of Amta-II Block

under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 36,02,234 Product Category CIVIL WORKS Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Bukshi Khal at 11.26 km Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218586.xls BOQ 328.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:44 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...

2 of 2 20/08/2017 3:06 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:07 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_7

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 69,687 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS
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Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-7

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Bukshi Khal near Bukshi Bridge in G.P. Kashmoli of Amta-II

Block under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 34,84,355 Product Category CIVIL

WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Bukshi Khal near Bukshi

Bridge

Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE

LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218588.xls BOQ 328.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

2. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

3. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:47 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:07 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_8

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 72,786 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...
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Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-8

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Short Cut Diversion Channel at 5.50 km in G.P. Jhamtia of

Amta-II Block under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 36,39,300 Product Category CIVIL

WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Short Cut Diversion Channel at

5.50 km

Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE

LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218589.xls BOQ 319.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:50 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:08 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_9

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 28,716 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...
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Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-9

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Short Cut Diversion Channel at 5.60 km in G.P. Jhamtia of

Amta-II Block under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 14,35,816 Product Category CIVIL

WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Short Cut Diversion Channel at

5.60 km in G.P. Jh

Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE

LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218590.xls BOQ 316.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:53 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Aug-2017 03:09 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN||WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

Tender Reference

Number
WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18

Tender ID 2017_CE2_124823_10

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical

Evaluation Allowed
No

ItemWise Technical Evaluation

Allowed
No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For

BOQ
No

Is Multi Currency

Allowed For Fee
No

Payment Instruments

Online

Bankers
S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover

No
Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual

/Technical
.pdf SNIT-7

.pdf FORMS

.pdf 2911_i

2 Finance .xls BOQ

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION

CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,

LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 

3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 

PARTNERSHIP DEED,

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,

MOA,TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2 

5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 

6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 

7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 2 

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in 23,281 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type percentage EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Payable To EE LDCD EMD Payable At ONLINE NET BANKING/

NEFT/ RTGS

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=Publ...
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Work /Item(s)

Title WBIW/EE/LDCD/e-NIT- 7/2017-18/ SL-10

Work Description Restoration of Breach on Right Embankment of Short Cut Diversion Channel at 2.60 km in G.P. Thaliya of

Amta-II Block under Lower Damodar Construction Division during August 2017

Pre Qualification

Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External

Monitor

NA 

Tender Value in 11,64,056 Product Category CIVIL

WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 90 

Location Short Cut Diversion Channel at

2.60 km in G.P. Th

Pincode 711316 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting

Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE

LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Document Download / Sale End

Date

25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Aug-2017 10:30 AM Bid Submission End Date 25-Aug-2017 12:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT

Document S.No Document Name Description
Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf SNIT-7 302.94

Work Item

Documents
S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size

(in KB)

1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911_i 346.76

2 BOQ BOQ_218592.xls BOQ 316.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Bid Opener Designation

1. sewc1iwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH SE

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA EXECUTIVE ENGINEER

3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA EE

Tender Inviting Authority

Name EE LDCD

Address Executive Engineer Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation EE

Created Date 20-Aug-2017 02:56 PM
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